CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Bruce - | just printed out the spreadsheet and then scanned it. It is attached.
When | print and scan, though, you cannot read the full answer in some of the cells. So then | expanded the cell size, which

made it print very small.
Can you read these? Can you see the signature?

If this doesn’t work, | may just hop in my car and drive over to DDSN to meet you and sign in person!! {Actually, maybe |
should do that anyway. It always makes me nervous for DDSN to mail such a large check!)

Thanks -

Lorri @

From: caspprinter035@gmail.com <caspprinter035@gmail.com>
Date: Tuesday, October 31, 2023 at 11:26 AM

To: lunumb@casproviders.org <lunumb@-casproviders.org>
Subject: Message from KM_C458

Confidentiality Notice:

The information contained in this transmission, including attachments may contain privileged and confidential information
including consumer/patient information protected by federal and state privacy laws. It is intended only for the use of the
person(s) named above. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any review, dissemination,
distribution, or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the
sender by reply email and destroy all copies of the original message.



Re: Trying again

Lorri Unumb <lunumb@-casproviders.org>
Tue 10/31/2023 11:58 AM
To:Busbee, Bruce <Bruce.Busbee@ddsn.sc.gov>

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Awesome — thank you!!

From: Busbee, Bruce <Bruce.Busbee@ddsn.sc.gov>
Date: Tuesday, October 31, 2023 at 11:53 AM

To: Lorri Unumb <lunumb@casproviders.org>
Subject: Re: Trying again

We are good.

BRUCE BUSBEE, MPH
Budget Director

% Bruce.Busbee@ddsn.sc.gov n
., 803-898-9740

9 3440 Harden Street Ext, Columbia, SC 29203
Qo www.ddsn.sc.gov

»ie :
s¥= South Carolina
I Department of Disabilities and Special Needs

From: Busbee, Bruce <Bruce.Busbee@ddsn.sc.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, October 31, 2023 11:50 AM

To: Lorri Unumb <lunumb@casproviders.org>
Subject: Re: Trying again

Got it thanks. As long as | can get it to print; we are good.

Thank you,
Bruce

BRUCE BUSBEE, MPH
Budget Director

% Bruce.Busbee@ddsn.sc.gov n
{, 803-898-9740

9 3440 Harden Street Ext, Columbia, 5C 29203
Qo www.ddsn.sc.gov

e :
A South Carolina

Department of Disabilities and Special Needs

From: Lorri Unumb <lunumb@®casproviders.org>
Sent: Tuesday, October 31, 2023 11:45 AM
To: Busbee, Bruce <Bruce.Bushee@ddsn.sc.gov>

- e . o .



FY24 Earmarked Appropriations Disbursement Request form.xIsx

Lorri Unumb (via Google Sheets) <lorri.unumb@gmail.com>
Thu 10/19/2023 3:08 PM
To:Busbee, Bruce <Bruce Busbee@ddsn.sc.gov>

[m 1 attachments (66 KB)
FY24 Earmarked Appropriations Disbursement Request form.xlsx.pdf;

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Lorri Unumb attached a spreadsheet

0 Lorri Unumb (lorri.unumb@gmail.com) has attached the following
spreadsheet:

Hi Bruce -- Thanks so much for your message, and apologies for my delayed
response. | was running a big conference in Milwaukee.

The signed Disbursement Request form is attached. Please let me know if
you have trouble reading it or need anything further.

With kind regards -

Lorri

FY24 Earmarked Appropriations Disbursement Request form.xlsx

Google LLC, 1600 Amphitheatre Parkway, Mountain View, CA 94043, USA
You have received this email because lorri,unumb@gmail.com shared a spreadsheet with GC)()gle"I

you from Google Sheels.



Unumb Allocation

Busbee, Bruce <Bruce.Busbee@ddsn.sc.gov>
Tue 10/10/2023 4:00 PM

To:Lorriunumb@gmail.com <Lorri.unumb@gmail.com>
CeSwygert, Quincy <Quincy. Swygert@ddsn.sc.gov>

ﬂj 2 attachments (99 KB}
FY24 Quarterly Expenditure Report.xlsx; FY24 Earmarked Appropriations Disbursement Request form.xlsx,

Ms. Shealy;

| look forward to working with you and Unumb this year. Proviso 118.19 contains an appropriation of $5,000,000
{five million} to be distributed to the Unumb Center. These funds have been released by the Executive Budget
Office.

The requirements for processing these appropriations have changed several times during the last several years. |
am attaching the forms required by the Executive Budget Office. | have also attached the link to the Executive
Budget's Office where these forms are located. Proviso 117.21 also requires that you submit quarterly reports to
the Agency and identify any subrecipient non-profit entities.

https://www.admin.sc.gov/budget/earmarked_appropriations_reporting

These will assist in gathering the information that will be needed. Once these are received by my office, we will
process the payment to the organization.
Please call should you have additional questions,

I hope this information helps.

Sincerely,
Bruce C. Busbee

BRUCE , MPH
BUSBEE
Budget Director

Bruce.Busbee@ddsn.sc.gov n
 803-898-9740

9 3440 Harden Street Ext, Columbia, SC 29203
v www.ddsn.sc.gov

ye
v South Carolina

Department of Disabilities and Special Needs



